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10 Warning Signs That You’re Ready for a Career Transition 

By Carol Dickson-Carr 

1. You dread getting out of bed and going to work.  

But suppose you were in a job or profession that feeds your spirit. Just imagine how exciting it would be 
to jump out of bed and step right into it every single day!  

2. You’re exhausted, whether you’ve had no sleep or seven to eight hours of sleep.  

Your perception of life in general can often be skewed when you’re not rested. So it’s important that you 
have the energy and vitality to enjoy your life. You also need energy to enhance your productivity. Your 
ideal profession or job needs to give you an energy rush, not drain you.  

3. You watch the clock at work, longing for quitting time.  

Wouldn’t it be cool if instead you could say, “Wow, where did all the time go! I can’t believe it’s already 
5:00!”? Envision it now!  

4. You’re not getting any fulfillment out of your work.  

You’d be surprised how many people actually get paid for what they love to do. Why not be one of them?  

5. You’re not sure what you should do, but you do know that your current job isn’t doing it for you 
anymore.  

Take some time to list the gifts, talents, and interests that excite you. Now, imagine a job where you could 
use all of those ingredients every day!  

6. You’re finding that the job culture conflicts with your values and belief system.  

Self-awareness is a worthwhile exercise. If you’re already clear on your values and belief systems, it’s 
time to manifest the job or profession that is in line with them.  

7. You have a burning desire to try something new.  

Being restless can often be a good thing if you let it work for you. Use it to investigate exciting new 
opportunities. As Les Brown says, “You’ve got to be hungry!”  
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8. You have adverse physical reactions to going to work (such as digestive problems, headaches, 
insomnia, etc.).  

You probably have heard variations on the old saying, “If you don’t have your health, then you don’t have 
much else.” Equally true is that “If you don’t have your health, you can’t enjoy all that you’ve worked 
for.” You deserve so much more.  

9. You’re intrigued by others’ careers and job descriptions.  

If this is true, then I say go with it and start doing some research. Ask those people whose careers intrigue 
you to allow you to interview them, and ask for permission to tape them.  

10. You’d like more control of your emotions and more freedom/autonomy.  

“Oh oh oh oh what a feeling!” I’m quoting an old Toyota commercial that some of you may be too young 
to remember. But picture a man jumping for joy as high as he can with the look of excitement and pure 
joy on his face. To have total control…autonomy in a job or profession you love and are totally 
fulfilled… Close your eyes and envision it!  

If you agreed with at least five out of ten of these warning signs, you might want to consider changing 
your situation. A mentor, counselor, or career coach can help point you to the right resources and 
wholeheartedly support you in choosing, changing, preparing for, advancing, and reaching your career 
goals.  
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Carol Dickson-Carr is a productivity coach and life strategist who makes money using her creativity and 
helps others do the same. She has taught in community and business colleges, at the university level, and 
in private consultations to provide both academic knowledge and practical strategies for creating a 
fulfilling life. Her areas of expertise include: productivity, creativity, communication skills, audio 
production, time management, and self-discovery through personal assessment tools-- particularly the 
Myers-Briggs Type Indicator®.  

Carol is also the creator of the interview audio series, "Master Your Time and Live Your Dreams: 
Conversations with Coaches and Creatives Who Get It Done!" and is also co-author to the book, A Guide 
to Getting It: Purpose & Passion.  
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